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Anti-Aging Moisturiser

PRODUCT DESCRIPTION 
No matter your age, it is always important to care for your 
skin, and the doTERRA Anti-Aging Moisturiser can help you 
get the job done. This moisturiser combines cutting-edge 
ingredients with the CPTG Certified Pure Tested Grade 
essential oils of Lavender, Jasmine, Geranium, and 
Frankincense. Working together, these ingredients may 
promote the sensation of soft, healthy skin.

USES
•	 Incorporate the Anti-Aging Moisturiser into your morning 

and night time beauty routine for optimal results.

•	Easily take with you on-the-go because of it’s convenient, 
compact container.

•	Use the Anti-Aging Moisturiser with the doTERRA Anti-
Aging Eye Cream.

•	Use alongside the Essential Skin Care line to further your 
experience of CPTG-infused skin care products.

DIRECTIONS FOR USE
Apply with a light touch over face and neck. Use morning 
and night. Avoid contact with eyes.

CAUTIONS 
For external use only. Avoid direct contact with the eyes. If 
skin irritation occurs, discontinue use.

INGREDIENTS 
Water (Aqua), Cetearyl Alcohol, Glycerin, Glyceryl Stearate, 
Caprylic/Capric Triglyceride, Olea Europaea (Olive) Fruit 
Unsaponifiables, Betaine, Silica, Glyceryl Caprylate, 
Sodium Stearoyl Lactylate, Phenethyl Alcohol, Carbomer, 
Lavandula Angustifolia (Lavender) Oil, Sodium Phytate, 
Chlorphenesin, Xanthan Gum, Dimethicone, Vitis Vinifera 
(Grape) Seed Oil, Caprylhydroxamic Acid, Pelargonium 
Graveolens Oil, Boswellia Carterii Oil, Tocopheryl Acetate, 
Jasminum Grandiflorum Extract , Palmitoyl Tripeptide-5, 
Leucojum Aestivum Bulb Extract, Tocopherol, Yucca 
Schidigera Root Extract, Sodium Hydroxide, Acetyl 
Tetrapeptide-2, Caprylyl Glycol, Benzyl Benzoate, 
Citronellol, Geraniol, Limonene, Linalool.

•	 The glycerin, betaine, and olive fruit extract may 
improve the feelings of hydration in the skin.

•	 Includes CPTG Certified Pure Tested Grade 
essential oils of Lavender, Jasmine, Geranium and 
Frankincense for a pleasing aroma.
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